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said  County.  The  peti-
tioner  has  also  applied
for waiver of bond, waiv-
er  of  reports,  waiver of
statements,  and/or  grant
of  certain  powers  con-
tained  in  O.C.G.A.  §  53-
12-261. All interested per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted. All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections,  and  must  be
filed with the Court on or
before AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:________
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3457
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001074
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
MICHELLE  LAVETTE
VANN 
DECEASED 

PETITION FOR 
LETTERS OF 

ADMINISTRATION
NOTICE

TO:  ALL  HEIRS  AND
INTERESTED PARTIES
IN  THE  ESTATE  OF
MICHELLE  LAVETTE
VANN:
MILDRED  YVONNE
VANN  has  petitioned  to
be appointed Administra-
tor  of  the  estate  of
MICHELLE  LAVETTE
VANN, deceased, of said
County.  The  petitioner
has  also  applied  for
waiver of bond, waiver of
reports,  waiver of state-
ments,  and/or  grant  of
certain powers contained
in  O.C.G.A.  §  53-12-261.
All  interested  persons
are  hereby  notified  to
show cause why said pe-
tition  should  not  be
granted. All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections,  and  must  be
filed with the Court on or
before AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:________
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3459
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001026
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
WILLIAM HARRY 
HANNON 
DECEASED 

PETITION FOR 
LETTERS OF 

ADMINISTRATION
NOTICE

TO:  ALL  HEIRS  AND
INTERESTED PARTIES
IN  THE  ESTATE  OF
WILLIAM HARRY HAN-
NON:
JOHN HANNON has pe-
titioned  to  be  appointed
Administrator of  the  es-
tate  of  WILLIAM  HAR-
RY HANNON, deceased,
of said County. The peti-
tioner  has  also  applied
for waiver of bond, waiv-
er  of  reports,  waiver of
statements,  and/or  grant
of  certain  powers  con-
tained  in  O.C.G.A.  §  53-
12-261. All interested per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted. All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections,  and  must  be
filed with the Court on or
before AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:______
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3461
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001038
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
ROBERT JERE 
LANDERS 
DECEASED 

PETITION FOR 
LETTERS OF 

ADMINISTRATION
NOTICE

TO:  ALL  HEIRS  AND
INTERESTED PARTIES
IN  THE  ESTATE  OF
ROBERT  JERE  LAN-
DERS:
KATHERINE LANDERS
BLACKBURN  has  peti-
tioned  to  be  appointed
Administrator of  the  es-
tate  of  ROBERT  JERE
LANDERS, deceased,  of
said  County.  The  peti-
tioner  has  also  applied
for waiver of bond, waiv-
er  of  reports,  waiver of
statements,  and/or  grant
of  certain  powers  con-
tained  in  O.C.G.A.  §  53-
12-261. All interested per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted. All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections,  and  must  be
filed with the Court on or
b G S

before AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_______
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3462
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001039
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
LANAWATY NG 
DECEASED 

PETITION FOR 
LETTERS OF 

ADMINISTRATION
NOTICE

TO:  ALL  HEIRS  AND
INTERESTED PARTIES
IN  THE  ESTATE  OF
LANAWATY NG:
ERIC  SHEN  has  peti-
tioned  to  be  appointed
Administrator of  the  es-
tate of LANAWATY NG,
deceased, of said County.
The  petitioner  has  also
applied  for  waiver  of
bond,  waiver of reports,
waiver  of  statements,
and/or  grant  of  certain
powers  contained  in
O.C.G.A.  §  53-12-261.  All
interested  persons  are
hereby  notified  to  show
cause  why  said  petition
should  not  be  granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be  filed  with
the  Court  on  or  before
AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:______
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3093
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000651
IN RE: ESTATE OF
JANICE  ELAINE
SLOCUM- KEITH  
DECEASED 

PETITION FOR 
LETTERS OF 

ADMINISTRATION
NOTICE

TO:  ALL  HEIRS  AND
INTERESTED PARTIES
IN  THE  ESTATE  OF
JANICE  ELAINE
SLOCUM-KEITH:
RASHAUN  TOURE
SLOCUM  has  petitioned
to be appointed Adminis-
trator  of  the  estate  of
JANICE  ELAINE
SLOCUM-  KEITH,  de-
ceased,  of  said  County.
The  petitioner  has  also
applied  for  waiver  of
bond,  waiver of reports,
waiver  of  statements,
and/or  grant  of  certain
powers  contained  in
O.C.G.A.  §  53-12-261.  All
interested  persons  are
hereby  notified  to  show
cause  why  said  petition
should  not  be  granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be  filed  with
the  Court  on  or  before
JULY 31, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_________
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3460
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001036
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
TESFAMICHAEL
WOLDEYOHANNES 
DECEASED 

PETITION FOR 
LETTERS OF 

ADMINISTRATION
NOTICE

TO:  ALL  HEIRS  AND
INTERESTED PARTIES
IN  THE  ESTATE  OF
TESFAMICHAEL
WOLDEYOHANNES:
MEKONNEN  TESFA
WOLDEYOHANNES  has
petitioned  to  be appoint-
ed  Administrator  of  the
estate  of  TES-
FAMICHAEL WOLDEY-
OHANNES, deceased,  of
said  County.  The  peti-
tioner  has  also  applied
for waiver of bond, waiv-
er  of  reports,  waiver of
statements,  and/or  grant
of  certain  powers  con-
tained  in  O.C.G.A.  §  53-
12-261. All interested per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted. All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections,  and  must  be
filed with the Court on or
before AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount

ili b

of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:________
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville,  Georgia
30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3451
gpn18

RE:  PETITION  TO
TERMINATE  TEMPO-
RARY  GUARDIANSHIP
OF GEORGIA-ANN
CARLISSIA  WILLIAMS,
A MINOR
TO:  TRELLA  SHEREE
MITCHELL,  Temporary
Guardian
Date of Mailing, if appli-
cable: _________
Date  of  Publication,  if
applicable:  JULY  12,
2023

NOTICE
The  natural  guardian  of
the  above-named  minor
has  filed  a  petition  re-
questing  the termination
of  the  temporary
guardianship of such mi-
nor. You are hereby noti-
fied  that  the  guardian-
ship  will  be  terminated
unless you file a written
objection to the termina-
tion of said guardianship
within ten (10) days after
being  personally  served
with  notice;  after  mail-
ing of the notice; or after
the  last  date  of  publica-
tion  of  the notice  of  the
termination. 
If your objection is time-
ly  filed,  the  Probate
Court  shall  determine,
after notice and hearing,
whether  a  continuation
or dissolution of the tem-
porary guardianship is in
the  best interests  of  the
minor.
Date:_______.
WITNESS the Honorable
Judge of the
Gwinnett County Probate
Court
By:______
Clerk  of  the  Probate
Court

7/12,19,2023

GDP3452
gpn18

GWINNETT  COUNTY
PROBATE COURT
RE:  PETITION  TO
TERMINATE  TEMPO-
RARY  GUARDIANSHIP
OF  NAESHIA
NACHELLE
WILLIAMS, A MINOR
TO:  TRELLA  SHEREE
MITCHELL,  Temporary
Guardian
Date of Mailing, if appli-
cable: _______
Date  of  Publication,  if
applicable:  JULY  12,
2023

NOTICE
The  natural  guardian  of
the  above-named  minor
has  filed  a  petition  re-
questing  the termination
of  the  temporary
guardianship of such mi-
nor. You are hereby noti-
fied  that  the  guardian-
ship  will  be  terminated
unless you file a written
objection to the termina-
tion of said guardianship
within ten (10) days after
being  personally  served
with  notice;  after  mail-
ing of the notice; or after
the  last  date  of  publica-
tion  of  the notice  of  the
termination.
If your objection is time-
ly  filed,  the  Probate
Court  shall  determine,
after notice and hearing,
whether  a  continuation
or dissolution of the tem-
porary guardianship is in
the  best interests  of  the
minor.
Date:______.
WITNESS the Honorable
Judge of the
Gwinnett County Probate
Court
By:______
Clerk  of  the  Probate
Court

7/12,19,2023

GDP2609
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 22-E-002052
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
MARK S SCHINDLER,  
DECEASED 

PETITION BY 
PERSONAL 

REPRESENTATIVE
FOR WAIVER OF BOND

AND/OR GRANT OF
CERTAIN POWERS

NOTICE
ERIC  M  SCHINDLER
has petitioned for waiver
of  bond,  waiver  of  re-
ports,  waiver  of  state-
ments,  and/or  for  the
grant  of  certain  powers
contained  in  O.C.G.A.  §
53-12-261 in regard to the
above  estate.  All  inter-
ested persons are hereby
notified  to  show  cause
why said petition  should
not be granted. All objec-
tions to the petition must
be  in  writing,  setting
forth the grounds of any
such  objections,  and
must  be  filed  with  the
Court on or before JULY
17, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for the required aount of
filing  fees.  If  any objec-
tions are filed, a hearing
will  be  scheduled  at  a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_________
Hunter  Coleman,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

6/21,28,7/5,12,2023

GDP2617
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 20-E-001451
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
CHARLES  ROBINSON
REDDY, 
DECEASED 

NOTICE
IN  RE:  The  Petition  to
Resign as Personal Rep-
resentative  and  to  Ap-
point Successor Personal
Representative  in  the
above-referenced  estate
having been duly filed,
TO:  DIANA  NANJOWE
KHAMALA
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file objection,  if there is
any, to the petition to re-
sign  as  personal  repre-
sentative  and  to  appoint
successor  personal  rep-
resentative, in this Court
on  or  before  JULY  17,
2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless

li il

you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:
Brianna  Bray,  Clerk  of
the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

6/21,28,7/5,12,2023

GDP3100
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000986
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
SHERRY L GAUNT,  
DECEASED 

PETITION BY 
PERSONAL 

REPRESENTATIVE
FOR WAIVER OF BOND

AND/OR GRANT OF
CERTAIN POWERS

NOTICE
JAMIE  BRIGHTHARP
has/have  petitioned  for
waiver of bond, waiver of
reports,  waiver of state-
ments,  and/or  for  the
grant  of  certain  powers
contained  in  O.C.G.A.  §
53-12-261 in regard to the
above  estate.  All  inter-
ested persons are hereby
notified  to  show  cause
why said petition  should
not be granted. All objec-
tions to the petition must
be  in  writing,  setting
forth the grounds of any
such  objections,  and
must  be  filed  with  the
Court on or before JULY
31, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:________
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3117
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001019
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
MARY JANE 
MITCHELL, 
DECEASED 

PETITION BY
PERSONAL

REPRESENTATIVE
FOR WAIVER

OF BOND AND/OR
GRANT OF CERTAIN

POWERS
NOTICE

SHIRLEY  JEAN
WEEKS  has/have  peti-
tioned  for  waiver  of
bond,  waiver of reports,
waiver  of  statements,
and/or  for  the  grant  of
certain powers contained
in O.C.G.A. § 53-12-261 in
regard  to  the  above  es-
tate.  All  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted. All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections,  and  must  be
filed with the Court on or
before JULY 31, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:______
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP2614
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000830
IN RE: ESTATE OF
CHRISTINA  JACKSON
F/K/A
CHRISTINA  A  BAR-
TOLOTTA A/K/A
TINA  JACKSON  BAR-
TOLOTTA A/K/A
TINA JACKSON,
DECEASED
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  SCOTT
JACKSON,  for  a  years
support  from  the  estate
of  CHRISTINA  JACK-
SON  F/K/A  CHRISTINA
A  BARTOLOTTA  A/K/A
TINA  JACKSON  BAR-
TOLOTTA  A/K/A  TINA
JACKSON, Deceased, for
decedents  surviving
spouse  and  minor  chil-
dren,  having  been  duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 17, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_____
Hunter  Coleman,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

6/21,28,7/5,12,2023

GDP2619
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000927
S O

IN RE: ESTATE OF 
HUBERT DIXON JR,  
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  LILLIE
DIXON, for a years sup-
port  from  the  estate  of
HUBERT  DIXON  JR,
Deceased,  for  decedents
surviving  spouse,  having
been duly filed, all inter-
ested persons are hereby
notified to show cause, if
any they have, on or be-
fore JULY 17, 2023, why
said  petition  should  not
be granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:____
Johnny  Yang,  Clerk  of
the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

6/21,28,7/5,12,2023

GDP2778
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000926
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
ROBERT  DAVID  MOR-
GAN, 
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The Petition of ANNE B.
MORGAN,  for  a  years
support  from  the  estate
of  ROBERT  DAVID
MORGAN, Deceased, for
decedents  surviving
spouse, having been duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 24, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

6/28,7/5,12,19,2023

GDP3070
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 22-E-002083
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
MARY  ELIZABETH
CARLISLE, 
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  LOGAN
BRAMBLETT
CARLISLE,  for  a  years
support  from  the  estate
of  MARY  ELIZABETH
CARLISLE,  Deceased,
for  decedents  surviving
spouse, having been duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 31, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing. 
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:______
Alisha Wilhelm, Clerk of
the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3088
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000497
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
EVAN MICHAEL SIELI,
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  THARY
NOP SIELI,  for  a years
support  from  the  estate
of  EVAN  MICHAEL
SIELI,  Deceased,  for
decedents  surviving
spouse  and  minor  chil-
dren,  having  been  duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 31, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3092
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 21-E-001338
IN RE: ESTATE OF
THOMAS MICHAEL
BRANNON,
DECEASED
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The Petition of THOMAS
MICHAEL  BRANNON,
JR., for  a years support
from  the  estate  of
THOMAS  MICHAEL
BRANNON,  Deceased,
for  decedents  surviving
spouse, having been duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 31, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted. 
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3102
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000995
IN RE: ESTATE OF
KENNETH D KULAS,
DECEASED
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  BAR-
BARA  A  KULAS,  for  a
years  support  from  the
estate  of  KENNETH  D
KULAS,  Deceased,  for
decedents  surviving
spouse, having been duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 31, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3112
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 22-E-000372
IN RE: ESTATE OF
ADAM DANIEL HARDT,
DECEASED
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The Petition of ANGELI-
CA COURY HARDT, for
a years support from the
estate of ADAM DANIEL
HARDT,  Deceased,  for
decedents  surviving
spouse  and  minor  chil-
dren,  having  been  duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
JULY 31, 2023,  why said
petition  should  not  be
granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3443
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001023
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
AGUSTIN JESUS 
RODRIGUEZ, 
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  CRISTI-
NA ANNE FOLEY, for a
years  support  from  the
estate  of  AGUSTIN  JE-
SUS  RODRIGUEZ,  De-
ceased,  for  decedents
surviving  spouse,  having
been duly filed, all inter-
ested persons are hereby
notified to show cause, if
any they have, on or be-
fore  AUGUST  7,  2023,
why said petition  should
not be granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court

By:____
Johnny  Yang,  Clerk  of
the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3463
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001048
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
ELOY CABRERA, 
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  LIDIA
CHAVEZ DE CABRERA,
for a years support from
the  estate  of  ELOY
CABRERA,  Deceased,
for  decedents  surviving
spouse, having been duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
AUGUST  7,  2023,  why
said  petition  should  not
be granted. 
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3464
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001077
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
HARRY LEE COFIELD,
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The  Petition  of  BAR-
BARA JOYCE RUSS, for
a years support from the
estate  of  HARRY  LEE
COFIELD, Deceased, for
decedents  surviving
spouse, having been duly
filed,  all  interested  per-
sons  are  hereby notified
to  show  cause,  if  any
they  have,  on  or  before
AUGUST  7,  2023,  why
said  petition  should  not
be granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:____
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3458
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001076
IN RE: ESTATE OF
RAYMOND JOHN 
KOWALEWSKI, 
DECEASED 
NOTICE OF PETITION
TO FILE FOR YEARS

SUPPORT
The Petition of VERONI-
CA  MARGARET
KOWALEWSKI,  for  a
years  support  from  the
estate  of  RAYMOND
JOHN  KOWALEWSKI,
Deceased,  for  decedents
surviving  spouse,  having
been duly filed, all inter-
ested persons are hereby
notified to show cause, if
any they have, on or be-
fore  AUGUST  7,  2023,
why said petition  should
not be granted.
All objections to the peti-
tion  must  be  in  writing,
setting forth the grounds
of  any  such  objections,
and  must  be filed  on  or
before the time stated in
the  preceding  sentence.
All  objections  should  be
sworn to before a notary
public  or  before  a  pro-
bate court clerk, and fil-
ing  fees  must  be  ten-
dered  with  your  objec-
tions,  unless  you  qualify
to file as an indigent par-
ty. Contact probate court
personnel  for  the  re-
quired  amount  of  filing
fees.  If  any  objections
are  filed,  a  hearing  will
be  scheduled  at  a  later
date. If no objections are
filed the petition may be
granted  without  a  hear-
ing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_______
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP2610
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000592
IN RE: ESTATE OF
JOE DAVID LAWHORN,
SR.,
DECEASED

NOTICE
IN  RE:  The  Petition  to
Probate  Will  in  Solemn
Form in the above-refer-
enced estate having been
duly filed,
TO:  ZERIC  LAWHORN,
JR.,  JAMIA  RENAE
CARLISE,  MICHALE
ANTONIO  LAWHORN,
MARCUS  JUANQUEZ
LAWHORN, JOE DAVID
LAWHORN,  JR.,  AND
JAMARRA  DAVINA
BROWN:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file objection,  if there is
any,  to  the  petition  to
probate  will  in  solemn
form, in this Court on or
before JULY 17, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
j i il d h

jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:
Brianna  Bray,  Clerk  of
the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

6/21,28,7/5,12,2023

GDP3108
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-000722
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
DONALD  MARVIN
MAXEY, SR., 
DECEASED 

NOTICE
IN  RE:  The  Petition  to
Probate  Will  in  Solemn
Form in the above-refer-
enced estate having been
duly filed,
TO: DAVID M. MAXEY:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file objection,  if there is
any,  to  the  petition  to
probate  will  in  solemn
form, in this Court on or
before JULY 31, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive, 
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/5,12,19,26,2023

GDP3444
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 23-E-001070
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
ROGER LAMAR 
BOTTOMS, 
DECEASED 

NOTICE
IN  RE:  The  Petition  to
Probate  Will  in  Solemn
Form in the above-refer-
enced estate having been
duly filed,
TO:  AMY  CHRISTINE
WALKER  AND  BETH
NERINE ROLLINS
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file objection,  if there is
any,  to  the  petition  to
probate  will  in  solemn
form, in this Court on or
before AUGUST 7, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:
Brianna  Bray,  Clerk  of
the Probate Court
75  Langley  Drive,
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12,19,26,8/2,2023

GDP3471
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 21-E-002155
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
DORIS J BENNETT,  
DECEASED 

NOTICE
[For Discharge from Of-

fice and all Liability]
IN RE: Petition for  Dis-
charge  of Personal  Rep-
resentative
TO:  ALL  BENEFICIA-
RIES OF SAID WILL OF
DECEDENT,  ALL
CREDITORS  OF  THE
ESTATE,  ALL  INTER-
ESTED  PARTIES,  AND
TO  WHOM  IT  MAY
CONCERN:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file an objection, if there
is  any,  to the above-ref-
erenced  petition,  in  this
Court on or before JULY
24, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:____
Danisher  Joseph,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12/2023

GDP3445
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 21-E-001723
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
STEVEN WARREN 
JOHNSON, 
DECEASED 

NOTICE
[For Discharge from Of-

fice and all Liability]
IN RE: Petition for  Dis-
charge  of Personal  Rep-
resentative
TO:  ALL  BENEFICIA-
RIES  UNDER  SAID
WILL  OF  DECEDENT,
ALL  OTHER  INTER-
ESTED  PARTIES  AND
TO  WHOM  IT  MAY
CONCERN:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file an objection, if there
is  any,  to the above-ref-
erenced  petition,  in  this
Court on or before JULY
24, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
i il d h i

tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_______
Johnny Yang, Clerk of 
the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12/2023

GDP3446
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 04-000072
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
JAMES HOWARD 
WEBB, JR., 
DECEASED 

NOTICE
[For Discharge from Of-

fice and all Liability]
IN RE: Petition for  Dis-
charge  of Personal  Rep-
resentative
TO:  ALL  BENEFICIA-
RIES  UNDER  SAID
WILL  OF  DECEDENT,
ALL  OTHER  INTER-
ESTED  PARTIES  AND
TO  WHOM  IT  MAY
CONCERN:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file an objection, if there
is  any,  to the above-ref-
erenced  petition,  in  this
Court on or before JULY
24, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:______
Sydney  Galloway,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12/2023

GDP3447
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 20-E-000536
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
JUNE  MACQUARRIE
HENRY, 
DECEASED 

NOTICE
[For Discharge from Of-

fice and all Liability]
IN RE: Petition for  Dis-
charge  of Personal  Rep-
resentative
TO:  ALL  BENEFICIA-
RIES OF SAID WILL OF
DECENDET,  ALL
CREDITORS  OF  THE
ESTATE,  ALL  INTER-
ESTED  PARTIES,  AND
TO  WHOM  IT  MAY
CONCERN:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file an objection, if there
is  any,  to the above-ref-
erenced  petition,  in  this
Court on or before JULY
24, 2023
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:________
Danisher  Joseph,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12/2023

GDP3448
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 20-E-000832
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
VESTAL MONROE 
HOOPER,  
DECEASED 

NOTICE
[For Discharge from Of-

fice and all Liability]
IN RE: Petition for  Dis-
charge  of Personal  Rep-
resentative
TO:  ALL  BENEFICIA-
RIES OF SAID WILL OF
DECEDENT,  ALL
CREDITORS  OF  THE
ESTATE,  ALL  INTER-
ESTED  PARTIES,  AND
TO  WHOM  IT  MAY
CONCERN:
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file an objection, if there
is  any,  to the above-ref-
erenced  petition,  in  this
Court on or before JULY
24, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel
for  the required  amount
of filing fees.  If  any ob-
jections are filed, a hear-
ing will be scheduled at a
later  date.  If  no  objec-
tions are  filed,  the  peti-
tion  may  be  granted
without a hearing.
Christopher A. Ballar
Judge  of  the  Probate
Court
By:_____
Danisher  Joseph,  Clerk
of the Probate Court
75 Langley Drive
Lawrenceville, GA 30046
770-822-8350

7/12/2023

GDP3449
gpn18

IN THE PROBATE
COURT OF GWINNETT

COUNTY
STATE OF GEORGIA

ESTATE NO. 21-E-000419
IN RE: ESTATE OF 
ELLEN WADE FINLEY,
DECEASED 

NOTICE
[For Discharge from Of-

fice and all Liability]
IN RE: Petition for  Dis-
charge  of Personal  Rep-
resentative
TO:  ALL  BENEFICIA-
RIES OF SAID WILL OF
DECEDENT,  ALL
CREDITORS  OF  THE
ESTATE,  ALL  INTER-
ESTED  PARTIES,  AND
TO  WHOM  IT  MAY
CONCERN
This  is  to  notify  you  to
file an objection, if there
is  any,  to the above-ref-
erenced  petition,  in  this
Court on or before JULY
24, 2023.
BE  NOTIFIED  FUR-
THER: All objections to
the  petition  must  be  in
writing, setting forth the
grounds of  any such  ob-
jections.  All  objections
should  be  sworn  to  be-
fore  a  notary  public  or
before  a  probate  court
clerk,  and  filing  fees
must  be  tendered  with
your  objections,  unless
you qualify to file as an
indigent  party.  Contact
probate  court  personnel

h i d


